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Om Shanti!     
I heard Baba has great appreciation for double foreigners, for their honest heart, honesty 
by nature. A personality which has the power of purity, will definitely have honesty. 
Honesty really begins with one’s own self. Am I honest with myself or am I deceiving 
myself? Sometimes it could happen that I know that I have some weaknesses or I make 
some mistakes but immediately realize and go to Baba and talk  about it and then take 
Baba’s blessings so that you are able to remove that, transform that. Every night, Baba 
and Mamma would come to class and Baba would ask if  anyone wanted to share what 
they did that was not right during the day and tell Baba. So some will get up, while some 
will say, “Oh if I tell Baba what will Baba think”, not knowing that Baba will know from your 
face or from your activity that you are trying to hide something.  If you speak the truth in 
a way it gets you over what you did and you don’t do it again, then Baba forgives us. God 
loves truth, so if you are truthful then there should not be this fear. “Oh, my image will go 
down in Baba’s heart”, rather your image will be uplifted in Baba’s heart, if you are honest. 
So there are two things, one is realization and second is the necessity to speak about it. 
I remember when Didi Manmohini was there, she used to love if I went and said, Didi, 
today I shouldn’t have done it, I have to be more careful about this, instead of reacting or 
being defensive.  Didi Manmohini would give us advice and she always used to say 1, 2, 
3.. these three points you should pay attention to. So then I said to Didi, can I tell now 
what I will do and I will say 1, 2, 3 and she would say, “Yes”. So, by saying it I would get 
blessings, powers or some direction, because they have good wishes for us so that we 
constantly progress.  
 
Sometimes you sit for simple conversation then start talking about the mistakes of others, 
what others are like, should do this, shouldn't do that, right! And actually nobody has given 
us this duty to watch for others, it is our habit, right! And then what happens? We keep it 
in our mind then we have that attitude towards that person which is an obstacle for the 
Yagya because then the atmosphere becomes very heavy, not loving. When everyone 
sees that you are so content, you are so occupied with what you have to do, you are so 
loving in a relationship, very cooperative in Yagya tasks, it will inspire many souls. Dadi 
Janki said to talk about someone is creating karmic accounts. Why should our attention 
only be on others?  If this one does then I will do, no! I always do what I have to do for 
Yagya. I am doing it for Baba, I am not doing it for anyone, right! When there is purity of 
personality you are honest that means you are only keeping an eye on yourself. The 
influence what you are pointing out of the person could become your nature. It’s a big 
loss, isn’t it? Everyone goes through this spiritual journey, let’s start from today. You 
cannot worry about the past, right! Even if that person is like that then I should look at the 
original form. One time Baba said even if someone has 98 defects at least they will have 



two qualities, you look at those two qualities, look at the unlimited heart, look at the hard 
work, look at whatever two good qualities everyone has around you. Then you will have 
from your heart love for that soul and good wishes because at least that person is doing, 
right! I always feel that one is to have a desire for unity, the other is the ability to create 
unity. That is only possible if I have realization and then I play my part accurately. I am 
creating my elevated actions, elevated thoughts, elevated words towards everyone. So 
it’s always good to look at yourself honestly, be honest with Baba, honest with Yagya and 
honest with my own self.  
 
Today's blessing was also that when there is purity there is joy and peace. So I stay 
happy, I am very peaceful because of honesty. Every night before sleeping I should be 
honest with Baba and tell my mistakes to Baba. You can only get extra marks if you are 
an observer and whatever is there you just cooperate. So every night that’s why Baba 
says very few children keep chart, because they don’t know what to write. So honesty is 
a very subtle quality and it should really start all the time from the self. As much as you 
are honest to self, you are honest to Baba also. I came to Baba, Baba gave me the task 
of creation of the Golden age, so what do I have to do? I just get engaged in my task, and 
become satopradhan, remember Baba and keep myself engaged through my words, 
thoughts and actions in Baba’s task. 
 
Some think honesty is frankness. I tell that person honestly what that one has, but that’s 
not honesty because that’s coming from anger, that’s coming from frustration, that’s 
coming from a lack of love. So even if we try to make person understand it will not work. 
My own personal realizations will help me to improve myself. I always find that it is so 
useful to always see where I need to improve. Why do I think about where others need to 
improve? If I am doing that then at least my heart will have a lot of love and good wishes 
and I keep getting marks from Baba, that this child is very honest. I know that a lot of 
things could happen and are happening but how much time and energy do I need to 
spend? I don’t have time for all that, right! You sit anywhere and study Murli, anyone who 
will look at that will say look at her, she is studying Murli. If I am doing something right, it 
will inspire others, but if I am just sitting and seeing what shouldn’t happen, what should 
happen, why are you wasting your time? You can study, you can churn, you can do yoga, 
you can do karma yoga. A lot of souls were asking me why you are able to get this role. I 
said I don’t know, but one thing I can definitely give a certificate to myself is that in my life 
I try not to get involved, just give blessings to every soul.  I feel whatever that soul is 
doing, I won’t be able to do. So I should support it, be cooperative, this is my honesty 
towards Yagya. So that other souls are light and do what they are planning to do. Honesty 
is a great power but it is really part of purity of one's personality. If you can't do anything 
just say it, but don’t make excuses. Many souls I feel you ask them from your heart, can 
you do this?  Maybe practically they cannot, they could say that immediately instead of 



making excuses until the other party says, okay don’t do it. Some have the habit also of 
making excuses. I am saying I really want to do it, but I cannot. I feel if you really want to 
do it, you will be able to. I have seen anything you want done, the right person will emerge, 
the right resources will come, because you have a pure thought. Those who really have 
that honesty will know and not even ask that person, knowing they will not do it or are not 
willing, or not ready. So there are very subtle ways where there is lack of honesty with the 
self. I feel self transformation, self improvement is to just be very honest. As Baba uses 
the word honesty as truthful, there is no harm to accept your limitations. You can accept 
your limitations and keep the aim to change them. Make them unlimited and you will find 
the difference in you, the change will come. If there is no realization, then there cannot 
be that transformation. So I feel honesty, they say is the best policy but also internally 
remain very light and your every thought, every moment will be used in a worthwhile way. 
Today Baba said even to have waste is lack of purity whether waste thoughts, wasting 
time or anything. In total honesty you are able to use everything in a worthwhile way and 
create your unlimited fortune and that’s when Baba says you have your birthright, where 
you receive your attainments from Baba.  
 
Om Shanti! 


